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Please note that this information is for the period May, June and July 2025.
You asked:
Q1. How many patients have a current diagnosis of Giant Cell Arteritis (GCA) (ICD10 codes M31.5 or M31.6) at your Health Board?  	
785
Q2. How many patients have been newly diagnosed with Giant Cell Arteritis (GCA) (ICD10 codes M31.5 or M31.6) in the past 3 months?	
12
Q3. How many patients were treated by the Rheumatology department for Giant Cell Arteritis (GCA) (ICD10 codes M31.5 or M31.6)?  	
111
Q4. How many patients were treated by the rheumatology department in the past 3 months with the following: 
· Tocilizumab – for any disease 	
178
· Tocilizumab for rheumatoid arthritis (RA) only 
This information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 
· Tocilizumab for giant cell arteritis (GCA) only 
This information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

Q5. How many patients were treated by the ophthalmology department (for any disease) in the past 3 months with Tocilizumab?
0

Q6. How many patients were treated in A&E in the past 3 months for giant cell arteritis (GCA) with Tocilizumab?
This information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

Q7. In the past 3 months how many patients with a primary diagnosis of GCA (ICD10 codes M31.5 or M31.6) were:
· Admitted as an inpatient	
0 
None were admitted as an inpatient.  9 individual patients were admitted in this period as a Day Case or RDA.  

· Treated in A&E	
0 
There were no patients treated in A&E who then went on to be admitted with a primary diagnosis of M31.5 or M31.6 during this time period
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We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
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