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Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 25-J-006






You asked:
I would be grateful if you could provide the following information for the period 1 July 2024 – 30 June 2025, broken down per AfC pay band (Bands 2–9, excluding medical and dental roles):
1. Shortlisting outcomes by gender
1.1 Number of applicants shortlisted by gender.
2. Number of applicants not shortlisted by gender.

External Applicants
	
	Shortlisted
	Not shortlisted

	Male
	1371
	9621

	Female
	2913
	15843

	I do not wish to disclose
	25
	80

	Total
	4309
	25544



Internal Applicants
	
	Shortlisted
	Not Shortlisted

	Male
	447
	558

	Female
	1876
	1844

	I do not wish to disclose
	6
	10

	Total
	2329
	2412



3. Interview outcomes by gender
3.1 Number of applicants interviewed by gender.
3.2 Number of applicants not interviewed by gender.
External Applicants

	
	Interview attended

	Male
	860

	Female
	1842

	I do not wish to disclose
	14

	Total
	2716



Internal Applicants

	
	Interview attended

	Male
	356

	Female
	1403

	I do not wish to disclose
	5

	Total
	1764




4. Appointment outcomes by gender
4.1 Number of applicants offered a post by gender.
4.2 Number of applicants appointed by gender.
External Applicants

	Answer
	Appointed

	Male
	143

	Female
	437

	I do not wish to disclose
	<5*




Internal Applicants

	Answer
	Appointed

	Male
	116

	Female
	476

	I do not wish to disclose
	<5*



4.3 Number of applicants who withdrew or declined offers by gender.
I can confirm that this information is not held in this format.


5. Internal vs external applicants
5.1 Number of successful candidates who were existing staff (internal) vs external applicants, broken down by gender.
Please see question 3

6. Recruitment panel composition
6.1 If held, the gender breakdown of recruitment panel members for AfC Band 2–9 appointments.
I can confirm that this information is not held.

* Where fewer than 5 has been indicated we are unable to provide you with the exact number of applicants as due to the low numbers, there is a potential risk of identifying individuals if this was disclosed.  We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This information is protected by the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR.  This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.
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