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Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 25-E-038





You asked:
Please provide the information requested below for 1st January 2023 to 31st December 2023 and 1st January 2024 to 31st December 2024. 
1. Number of Patients at Each Stage of Prostate Cancer
0. Please provide the number of patients diagnosed and treated at your health board, broken down by the following stages:
0. ICD-10 C61 / M0 and M1-M1c (localised and metastatic disease).
I can confirm that SBUHB do not hold this information by number of patients with a current diagnosis nor by stage. However, we can provide you with the number of patients admitted for treatment within our hospitals under ICD-10 C61 for 2023 and 2024 respectively.
	Diagnosis
	2023
	2024

	Malignant neoplasm of prostate (C61)
	583
	481



1. Number of Patients at Each Stage on Hormone Therapies and/or Docetaxel
1. For the patient populations categorized above, please provide the number of patients who are:
0. Initiated on hormone therapies.
0. Continued on hormone therapies.
0. Initiated on docetaxel.
0. Continued on docetaxel.

Swansea Bay University Health Board does not record this information. These medications are prescribed via GP in the community. You will need to contact the individual practices for this information.

1. Volume of Drugs Prescribed (in packs)
For each of the following treatments used in managing prostate cancer, please provide the total quantity of drugs prescribed during the specified period: 1 January 2023 to 31 December 2023 and 1st January 2024 to 31st December 2024.
1. ADT Alone
1. Abiraterone (Zytiga) in combination with any ADT.
1. Abiraterone (Zytiga) – no ADT.
1. Enzalutamide (Xtandi) in combination with any ADT.
1. Enzalutamide (Xtandi) – no ADT.
1. Apalutamide (Erleada) in combination with any ADT.
1. Darolutamide (Nubeqa) in combination with any ADT.
1. Darolutamide (Nubeqa) in combination with any ADT and docetaxel.
1. Docetaxel in combination with any ADT.
To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 


_____________________________________________________________ 
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We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
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