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Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 25-E-029





Please note that this information has been provided for the period FY 2024/25.

You asked:
1. Does your organisation engage a Neutral Vend or Master Vend agency supplier for:

a. Medical
i. Name of the NV or MV agency supplier
Medacs

ii. Expiry date of contract with the NV or MV agency supplier?
September 2026
 
b. Allied Health Professionals (AHPs)
i. Name of the NV or MV agency supplier
Medacs

ii. Expiry date of contract with the NV or MV agency supplier
September 2026

c. Non-Medical, Non-Clinical (NMNC)
i. Name of the NV or MV agency supplier
All Wales framework – various suppliers

ii. Expiry date of contract with the NV or MV agency supplier
01.03.28 with the option of 1 year extension

d. Nursing 
i. Name of the NV or MV agency supplier
All Wales framework – various suppliers

ii. Expiry date of contract with the NV or MV agency supplier
01.03.28 with the option of 1 year extension

2. Does your organisation utilise a Direct Engagement (DE) supplier for:

a. Medical
i. Name of the DE provider
Medacs

ii. Expiry date of contract with the DE provider
September 2026

iii. % of DE currently achieved
97%

b. Allied Health Professionals (AHPs)
i. Name of the DE provider
Medacs

ii. Expiry date of contract with the DE provider
September 2026

iii. % of DE currently achieved
86%

c. Non-Medical, Non-Clinical (NMNC)
i. Name of the DE provider
ii. Expiry date of contract with the DE provider
iii. % of DE currently achieved
Not applicable – All Wales Framework

3. [bookmark: _Hlk188359164]For the most recent Financial Year you have available please can you supply the spend figures on temporary agency staffing (worker pay & agency commission only) for:
	[bookmark: RANGE!A2]a.       Medical
	£7,802,138

	b.       Allied Health Professionals (AHPs)
	£1,483,549

	c.       Non-Medical, Non-Clinical (NMNC)
	£1,569,312

	d.       Nursing
	£8,695,665


 
4. For the most recent Financial Year you have available please can you supply the number of hours worked by temporary agency workers for:
	a.       Medical
	29336.41667

	b.       Allied Health Professionals (AHPs)
	This information is not recorded in hours

	c.       Non-Medical, Non-Clinical (NMNC)
	*

	d.       Nursing
	252411.55



* this information is not recorded centrally. These staff are booked directly by the hiring areas. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of invoices which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

5. Where a contract is in place for the provision of a Neutral Vend, Master Vend and/or a Direct Engagement supplier, please can you advise who the lead contact or responsible officer within the organisation is for this contract? 
There is no single person responsible. 
sbu.nursebank@wales.nhs.uk
 
6. Alternatively please can you advise who is responsible for temporary agency staffing at the organisation across the following departments:
a. Workforce Lead
Name:
Job Title:
b. Procurement Lead
Name:
Job Title:
c. Finance Lead
Name:
Job Title:

No single individual in all areas. Please see question 5.

_____________________________________________________________ 
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