[image: C:\Users\su001508\Desktop\New logos Swansea Bay\Abertawe_Swansea NHS Health Board.jpg] Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol Bae Abertawe
Swansea Bay University Health Board
Gwasanaethau Corfforaethol | Corporate Services
Un Porthfa Talbot | One Talbot Gateway
Parc Ynni, Baglan | Baglan Energy Park
Port Talbot SA12 7BR
Ffôn Phone: 01639 684 363

	
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 25-E-025









You asked:

Emergency general surgery would include robotic assisted operations in any of: Acute surgical diseases of the abdomen, mesenteric ischaemia, appendectomies, cholecystectomies, hernias, bowel obstruction, adhesiolysis, diverticular disease, diverticulitis, incarceration, perforation, peritonitis, and acute conditions of the gastrointestinal tract.

To provide accurate procedure and diagnosis data we rely on clinical coding. There is a time delay for clinical coding which means these figures could increase over time.

1. The total numbers of Emergency general surgery operations performed between 1 January 2023-1 January 2025. Broken down by: Open, laparoscopic and robotic. For robotic surgeries please can this be further broken down into the type of robot in use for each operation (e.g. include Da Vinci, Versius, Freehand).

The number of Emergency General Surgery procedures coded at SBUHB main sites (Morriston, NPTH, Singleton) split by open, laparoscopic (includes procedure codes 'Y751', 'Y752' in spell) or Robotic assisted surgeries (includes procedure codes 'Y753', 'Y743', 'Y765' in spell) between 01/01/2023 and 31/12/2024, inclusive:

General Surgery
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	394
	373

	Open
	3782
	3397




1. Type and numbers of robot available in your health board and used in emergency general surgery cases (Examples include Da Vinci, Versius, Freehand, Soloassist, Microhand S, AESOP, Zeus).

We have 1 Vinci robot in SBUHB which is currently used in urology elective cases only.


1. The total numbers of Emergency general surgery operations performed between 1 January 2023-1 January 2025 occurring during out of hours (weekends, nights)

The number of Emergency General Surgery procedures coded at SBUHB main sites (Morriston, NPTH, Singleton) split by open, laparoscopic (includes procedure codes 'Y751', 'Y752' in spell) or Robotic assisted surgeries (includes procedure codes 'Y753', 'Y743', 'Y765' in spell) between 01/01/2023 and 31/12/2024, inclusive, performed on a weekend or Bank Holiday:

General Surgery
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	78
	63

	Open
	626
	525



I can confirm that SBUHB does not hold this information because procedure time is not recorded and so pre 8am or post 5pm procedures cannot be provided.


1. Number of robotic general surgery cases (both emergency and elective) performed between 1 January 2023-1 January 2025.

The number of General Surgery Robotic assisted surgeries (includes procedure codes 'Y753', 'Y743', 'Y765' in spell) coded at SBUHB main sites (Morriston, NPTH, Singleton) between 01/01/2023 and 31/12/2024, inclusive: 0.


1. Number the following operations performed between 1 January 2023-1 January 2025. Broken down by: Open, laparoscopic and robotic (with robotic surgeries further broken down into type of robot used if applicable)

The number of procedures (from the list provided) coded at SBUHB main sites (Morriston, NPTH, Singleton) split by open, laparoscopic (includes procedure codes 'Y751', 'Y752' in spell) or Robotic assisted surgeries (includes procedure codes 'Y753', 'Y743', 'Y765' in spell) between 01/01/2023 and 31/12/2024, inclusive:

Cholecystectomies 
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	396
	306

	Open
	35
	34

	Robotic
	<5*
	0




Laparotomies
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	0
	<5

	Open
	20
	19



Appendectomies
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	254
	221

	Open
	37
	26



Hernia repairs
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	33
	32

	Open
	460
	367

	Robotic
	0
	<5*




Hartmann’s procedures
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	<5*
	<5*

	Open
	34
	25




Adhesiolysis
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	93
	93

	Open
	131
	189

	Robotic
	0
	<5*




Small bowel resection
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	<5*
	6

	Open
	42
	46




1. Mean length of stay of patients who have undergone the following performed between 1 January 2023-1 January 2025. Broken down by: Open, laparoscopic and robotic.

The average length of stay for patients with procedures (from the list provided) coded at SBUHB main sites (Morriston, NPTH, Singleton) split by open, laparoscopic (includes procedure codes 'Y751', 'Y752' in spell) or Robotic assisted surgeries (includes procedure codes 'Y753', 'Y743', 'Y765' in spell) between 01/01/2023 and 31/12/2024, inclusive:

Cholecystectomies
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	<5*
	<5*

	Open
	20.20
	9.15

	Robotic
	0
	0




Laparotomies
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	0
	<5*

	Open
	20.75
	8.00




Appendectomies
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	<5*
	<5*

	Open
	6.57
	5.69




Hernia Repairs
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	<5*
	<5*

	Open
	<5*
	<5*

	Robotic
	0
	<5*




Hartmann’s procedures
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	18.25
	20.00

	Open
	16.18
	15.00




Adhesiolysis
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	<5*
	<5*

	Open
	7.78
	7.45

	Robotic
	 
	<5*




Small Bowel Resection
	Surgery Type
	2023
	2024

	Laparoscopic
	18.00
	<5*

	Open
	15.57
	26.13




1. The number and type of complications that occurred in robotic general surgery cases between 1 January 2023-1 January 2025.  Including but not limited to conversions to another type of surgery, device-related complications, injury to surrounding structures or tissue, serums, infection, leakage, hernias, mortality.

Nil.


1. [bookmark: _Hlk206146278]Number of staff trained to assist with robotic cases.

Approximately 8 members of staff have been trained to assist with robotic cases.


1. The average (Over 4 weeks) number of staff trained to assist in robotic surgery available out of hours (weekends/nights).

On average, between 1-2 members of staff, trained to assist in robotic surgery are available out of hours (weekends/nights).

*Where fewer than 5 has been indicated we are unable to provide you with the exact number of patients as due to the low numbers, there is a potential risk of identifying individuals if this was disclosed.  We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This information is protected by the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR.  This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.
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