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Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 25-B-013





This information has been provided for the period October 2024 to January 2025.

You asked:
1. Please provide the number of migraine patients treated in the last 4 months with: 

· Atogepant (Aquipta) – not recorded centrally*
· Erenumab (Aimovig) - 6 new patients / 43 repeat patients
· Eptinezumab (Vyepti) - not currently a treatment option in Swansea Bay
· Fremanezumab (Ajovy) - not currently a treatment option in Swansea Bay
· Galcanezumab (Emgality) - 0 new patients / 6 repeat patients
· Rimegepant (Vydura) - not recorded centrally*
· Botulinum Toxin (i.e., Botox, Dysport, Xeomin) - 65 new patients / 405 repeat patients

2. How many patients have you treated in the last 4 months for chronic migraine (15+ headache days per month) and episodic migraine (4-15 headache days per month) with the following drugs:

	Drugs
	Chronic Migraine (15+ headache days per month)
	Episodic Migraine (4-15 headache days per month)

	Atogepant
	not recorded centrally*
	n/a

	Erenumab
	6 new / 43 repeat
	n/a

	Eptinezumab
	n/a
	n/a

	Fremanezumab
	37 new / 64 repeat
	n/a

	Galcanezumab
	no new / 6 repeat
	n/a

	Rimegepant
	not recorded centrally*
	n/a

	Botulinum Toxin
	65 new / 405 repeat
	n/a



3. How many patients have you treated in the last 4 months for acute migraine with:

· Rimegepant (Vydura) - nil

4. Does the Health Board actively initiate a treatment pause (usually at 12 months) of anti-CGRP (calcitonin gene-related peptide inhibitors) migraine treatment with the aim to re-start treatment if the patient continues to fit the criteria (Yes/No)? 
No


* I can confirm that SBUHB do not record this information centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of patient records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.


_____________________________________________________________ 
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