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You asked:
Please provide the following information (as at 31/01/2025 or later) for each of the past three calendar years separately (2022, 2023, and 2024), ensuring that data for each year is reported individually rather than grouped together.
Additionally, please break down the data by hospital and by the responsible consultant orthopaedic surgeon (or, if data is recorded differently, by the most relevant classification available).
1. Total number of patients who had knee replacement operations performed in each year.
Please note that we have provided this information for our 3 main hospital sites. We have also provided figures for operations performed outside of the health board boundary via outsourcing arrangements under the category “private providers”.  

Procedures undertaken at Prince Philip Hospital are performed under a working agreement with Hywel Dda Health Board. Swansea Bay surgeons utilise the operating theatres at Prince Philip Hospital to treat Swansea Bay patients.
	
	Years

	
	2022
	2023
	2024

	Morriston Hospital
	8
	46
	53

	Neath Port Talbot Hospital
	171
	213
	256

	Singleton Hospital
	<5
	0
	0

	Prince Philip Hospital
	0
	0
	15

	
	
	
	

	Private Providers
	0
	17
	34



To break this down further by consultant would make the majority of the figures less than five. Due to the low numbers, there is a potential risk of identifying individuals if this was disclosed.  We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This information is protected by the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR.  This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.
2. [bookmark: _Hlk191280671]Number of successful knee replacement operations – defined as cases where no reported complications, mobility issues, or further interventions were required beyond routine post-operative care.
I can confirm that SBUHB do not record this information specifically. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of patient records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.

3. Number of patients who reported post-operative complications or dissatisfaction with their outcome (i.e., formal complaints, clinical concerns, or feedback indicating persistent pain, lack of mobility, or other issues).
I can confirm that SBUHB do not record dissatisfaction with outcomes unless they are submitted as complaints. Due to the way that information is recorded on our complaint recording system, to obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of complaints which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.

4. Number of patients who required follow-up or corrective surgery on the same knee following the initial knee replacement operation.
I can confirm that the information you are seeking is held online. Under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act (information accessible by other means), we are not required to provide information in response to a request if the information is already reasonably accessible to you. May I therefore recommend that you look at this link to obtain the information you require: https://surgeonprofile.njrcentre.org.uk/HospitalProfile?hospitalName=Neath%20Port%20Talbot%20Hospital 

We are not able to break this down further by year as due to the low numbers, there is a potential risk of identifying individuals if this was disclosed.  We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This information is protected by the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR.  This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.

5. Average patient waiting time for patients who received knee replacement operations during each of these years.
Please note that these figures include both routine and urgent knee replacements.
	Average of wait in weeks

	Years
	Total

	2022
	128.53

	2023
	127.16

	2024
	99.85

	Grand Total
	115.45
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We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
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