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Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 25-D-048





You asked:
1. What is the total number of parking spaces available to patients and visitors at Morriston Hospital?

There are 884 spaces available for patients and visitors.

2. What are the average and peak occupancy rates of the patient and visitor car parks at Morriston Hospital over the past year (from 16 April 24 to 16 April 25)?

Swansea Bay University Health Board does not hold this information. We are unable to measure occupancy as not all of the car parks have barriers at the entrances and exits to enable us to count cars. Therefore we are unable to monitor occupancy and utilisation.

3. How many complaints has the Health Board or Morriston Hospital received regarding parking availability and parking charge notices issued at Morriston Hospital in the past year (from 16 April 24 to 16 April 25)?

Swansea Bay University Health Board has received 6 parking availability complaints and 3 parking fine complaints within this date range. 

4. Please provide copies of any risk assessments or internal reports conducted by the NHS Trust or Morriston Hospital concerning parking capacity and demand at the hospital in the past three years.

Formal risk assessments have not been undertaken. Car parking capacity is regularly discussed at various meetings but no formal reports have been prepared. 

5. Please provide details of the contract or agreement between NHS Wales /Morriston Hospital and UK Car Park Management, specifically regarding parking enforcement, service level agreements related to parking capacity, and any clauses addressing situations of insufficient parking.

UK Car Parking Management do not operationally manage the car parking service within Morriston Hospital. They provide a “back office” administrative function. UK Car Parking Management provide the following in line with car park operational guidelines (please see attached appendix)

· Handheld devices and printers for use by Health Board Staff
· Notice processing of all Penalty Charge Notice (PCN) 
· Enforcement signage 
· Supply of replacement stationary and maintenance of handheld devices 
· Monthly reports that retrospectively outline actions for the month and the reconciliation of a profit share payment.
· Attendance at meetings

6. Are there any internal guidelines or policies at Morriston Hospital that address parking outside of marked bays when designated spaces are full? If so, please provide copies.

There are currently no policies in place. 

7. What is the total number of parking charge notices issued by UK Car Park Management at Morriston Hospital in the past year (from 16 April 24 to 16 April 25), categorized by the reason for issuance (including parking outside of marked bays)?

2661 Parking Charge Notices were issued during this time period. 

	Issued Reason 
	%

	Unauthorised Parking (ANPR)
	0

	Not Parked Wholly Within Bay
	44

	Parking in Disabled Bay without clearly displaying a Valid Disabled Badge
	19

	Exceeded Maximum Stay Period 
	22

	No Parking at Any Time
	15

	No Parking / No Stopping
	0

	Parked on Yellow Lines
	<1

	Parking on Footpath
	0

	Unauthorised Parking
	<1

	
	


8. What is the standard size (length and width) of the marked parking bays at Morriston Hospital?

Currently the recommendation is 2.4m x 4.8m, it used to be 2.1m in width.  All spaces fall between the recommended guidelines.

9. Does Morriston Hospital adhere to the recommendations outlined in Health Technical Memorandum (HTM) 07-03 (or its latest equivalent) regarding parking provision? If so, please provide details of the hospital's compliance.

Swansea Bay Health Board aims to comply with the recommendations but is unable to confirm if 100% compliant.
10.What date did UKMCM Ltd take over parking management for the    Morriston Hospital site? 

The contract commenced in November 2022. 

11.Detail yearly revenue Morriston Hospital or its affiliates/subsidiaries receive per annum as a result of PCN since the contract for parking management was handed to UKMCP Ltd. 

Swansea Bay University Health Board does not record this information for individual sites. 

12. Detail yearly revenue Morriston Hospital or its affiliates/subsidiaries receive per annum as a result of PCN for the 3 years preceding the contract for parking  management being handed to UKMCP Ltd. 

Swansea Bay University Health Board does not hold this information. 

13. Detail the dates of all complaints in the last 3 years claiming some sort of issue with the clarity and content of the parking signs. 

No complaints have been made about the clarity or content of the signage. 

__________________________________________________________________
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