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  Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 24-C-038






You asked:
Physical Health
1. Number of referrals for treatment to physical injuries due to disclosed domestic abuse or sexual assault 

This information is not held centrally. *

2. Number of referrals for physical injuries suspected to be caused from domestic abuse or sexual assault 
This information is not held centrally. *

3. The number of patients who attended GP surgery and disclosed domestic abuse 

This information is not held centrally. It would be held with each GP.

4. The number of patients who attended hospital and disclosed domestic abuse

	Year
	A&E attendances
	Admissions
	Health visitors

	2013
	5
	<5**
	n/a

	2018
	21
	6
	187

	2023
	19
	0
	108



A&E new attendances - "domestic abuse" specifically mentioned in presenting complaint/triage notes - may/may not be reason for attendance
Admissions/Discharges - clinically coded for the period with domestic abuse			
Note: NOT necessarily "disclosed", only recorded on system as part of the attendance/admission eg.many A&E attendances with injuries, where domestic abuse was noted		

5. The number of patients who disclosed domestic abuse to midwife or health visitors

See above table in Q4, in addition:

2013 – We would not hold the data prior to the formation of the Corporate Safeguarding team and the Violence Against Women Domestic Abuse and Sexual Violence (Wales) Act 2015

2018 -  <5** domestic abuse referrals from midwifery

2023 - 13 Domestic abuse referrals from midwifery

6. The number of patients who disclosed domestic abuse to another member of staff from the health board 
This information is not held centrally. *
Information regarding referrals to the Child and Adolescent Mental Health Services (CAMHS) in your Health Board area: 

7. Number of referrals to CAMHS: For each year from 1st of January- 31st of December, please provide the total number of referrals received by CAMHS in the following periods: 

     2013, 2018, 2023
Please note: The CAMHS Services were managed by Cwm Taf HB until 31st of March 2023.  

From April 2023 there were:-
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8. Number of referrals receiving a full assessment: For each year mentioned above, please provide the number of referrals that progressed to a full assessment by CAMHS. 
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9.Number of referrals declined: For each year mentioned above, please provide the number of referrals that were declined by CAMHS. 
From April 2023 to December 2023 <5** referrals was rejected as inappropriate

10. Number of referrals with high ACE score: For each year mentioned above, please provide the number of referrals involving children and young people under 18 who had an Adverse Childhood Experiences (ACE score) of 4 or over. 
ACE scores are not stored in a central database, therefore this information is not available. *

11. Number of referrals with domestic abuse history: For each year mentioned above, please provide the number of referrals involving children and young people under 18 who had a history of witnessing or being subjected to domestic abuse. 
Data on domestic abuse history is not stored in a central database, therefore this information is not available.*

12. Number of diagnosed children with additional needs and trauma history: 
For each academic year mentioned above, please provide the number of children and young people under 18 who: 

· Were diagnosed with or suspected to have additional learning needs or additional behavioural needs. 
Data regarding additional learning needs or behavioural needs is not stored in a central database, therefore this information is not available.

· Were also known to have experienced childhood trauma (including witnessing or being subjected to domestic abuse). 
Data regarding additional learning needs or behavioural needs is not stored in a central database, therefore this information is not available.


If possible please specify the type of additional learning or behavioural needs identified. 
Adult Mental Health: 

For each year from 1st of January- 31st of December for following years : 
2013, 2018, 2023	


15. Number of all referrals to Adult Mental Health Team
 
	Year
	Number of referrals to Adult MH Consultant Psychiatrists

	2013
	1774

	2018
	2720

	2023
	4223



16. Number of referrals that progressed to a full assessment by Adult Mental Health Team 
	Year
	Number of assessments by Adult MH Consultant Psychiatrists

	2013
	1236

	2018
	1956

	2023
	4223



17. For each year mentioned above, please provide the number of referrals that were declined by Adult Mental Health Team 

Our patient information systems prior to 2023 did not record if the referral was declined.  

In 2023 thirty five referrals were declined by the Single Point of Access Team:-
Inappropriate referrals – 7
Referred in error – 12
Declined as patient medically unfit for assessment – 16

18. For each year mentioned above, please provide the number of referrals of patients who had an Adverse Childhood Experiences (ACE score) of 4 or over. 
This information is not recorded on our patient information systems *

19. For each year mentioned above, please provide the number of referrals involving patients who had a history of witnessing domestic abuse 
This information is not recorded on our patient information systems *

20. For each year mentioned above, please provide the number of patients who had been a victim of domestic abuse in their lifetime *
This information is not recorded on our patient information systems *

21. For each year mentioned above, please provide the number of patients who have perpetrated domestic abuse in their lifetime 
This information is not recorded on our patient information systems *

* To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.

** Where fewer than 5 has been indicated we are unable to provide you with the exact number of patients as due to the low numbers, there is a potential risk of identifying individuals if this was disclosed.  We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This information is protected by the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR.  This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.



_____________________________________________________________ 
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2023  Apr  May  Jun  Jul  Aug  Sep  Oct  Nov  Dec  Total  

   159  191  163  113  101  139  168  137  98  1269  
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2023  Apr  May  Jun  Jul  Aug  Sep  Oct  Nov  Dec  Total  

Total  87  78  91  96  105  110  102  67  63  799  
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