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gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser
 caring for each other, working together, always improving

	
    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 24-C-029 





You asked:
1) How many referrals were made to your CAMHS services from 2018-2024? Please give individual figures for each year.

The CAMHS Services in South Wales was managed by Cwm Taf Health Board until 31st of March 2023.  Swansea Bay University Health Board took over management of the CAMHS service for the Swansea Bay area, from April 2023 and the figures were:

	2023-2024
	Apr
	May
	Jun
	Jul
	Aug
	Sep
	Oct
	Nov
	Dec
	Jan
	Feb
	Mar
	Total

	 
	159
	191
	163
	113
	101
	139
	168
	137
	98
	150
	115
	48
	1582




2) How many (already) diagnosed autistic children/teenagers were referred to your CAMHS services from 2018-2024? Please give individual figures for each year.
· If possible, could you also please provide the proportion (%) these referrals made up of the total number of referrals each year?

We are unable to provide this information, as our patient information system does not record any other conditions the patient may have on referral. *
* To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 


3) How many referrals were ‘rejected’ (i.e. not accepted by CAMHS/referred to another service) from 2018-2024? Please give individual figures for each year.
· If possible, could you also please provide information on why the referrals were rejected? 
From April 2023, two referrals were rejected as they were inappropriate for the service.
4) How many referrals of diagnosed autistic children/teenagers were ‘rejected’ from 2018-2024? Please give individual figures for each year.
· If possible, could you also provide the proportion (%) these rejections made up of the total number of rejections for each year please.

Please could you provide all of this information in calendar years.
We are unable to provide this information, as our patient information system does not record any other conditions the patient may have on referral. *
*To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.
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Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol Bae Abertawe yw enw gweithredu Bwrdd Iechyd Lleol Prifysgol Bae Abertawe
Swansea Bay University Health Board is the operational name of Swansea Bay University Local Health Board
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