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  Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 24-F-040






You asked:
Please proved information regarding the following systems:
1.      Clinical noting
2.      Diagnostic Reporting
3.      Digital Dictation
4.      Document Management
5.      E-Rostering (staffing)
6.      Laboratory Information Management System
7.      Pathology
8.      Pharmacy
9.      Sexual Health
10.     Theatres

Please enter 'No System Installed' or ‘No Department’ under supplier name if your trust does not use the system or have the department:
a) System type –
b) Supplier name –
c) System name –
d) Date installed –
e) Contract expiration –
f) Is this contract annually renewed? (Yes/No) -
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? (Yes/No) -
h) Procurement framework –
i) Other systems it integrates with? –
j) Total value of contract (£) –
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) -




Our Response:
1. Clinical Noting (WCP)

a) System type – Clinical Noting 
b) Supplier name – DHCW 
c) System name - WCP
d) Date installed - 2018
e) Contract expiration – *
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - *
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? *
 h) Procurement framework – *
i) Other systems it integrates with? – WPAS, WAP, WRRS, HEPMA, SIGNAL, WNCR
j) Total value of contract (£) – *
k) Notes –* 

* Swansea Bay Health Board does not hold this information. The system is procured on an All Wales basis by DHCW. May we suggest that you contact DHCW on DHCW.FOI@wales.nhs.uk who may be able to provide you with the information you require.


2. Diagnostic Reporting (Radiology)

a) System type – Diagnostic Reporting
b) Supplier name – Digital Health and Care Wales (DHCW)
c) System name – RADIS
d) Date installed – 24/11/2018
e) Contract expiration – n/a – ongoing contract
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Currently unknown as out to tender on an All Wales basis
h) Procurement framework – *
i) Other systems it integrates with? – n/a
j) Total value of contract (£) – *
k) Notes – None

* Swansea Bay Health Board does not hold this information. The system is procured on an All Wales basis by DHCW. May we suggest that you contact DHCW on DHCW.FOI@wales.nhs.uk who may be able to provide you with the information you require.

3. Digital Dictation

a) System type – Digital Dictation
b) Supplier name – Big Hand
c) System name – Big Hand
d) Date installed – 2018
e) Contract expiration – 31/12/2027
f) Is this contract annually renewed? – No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? – No 
h) Procurement framework – CCS 
i) Other systems it integrates with? – WPAS 
j) Total value of contract (£) –  £164,571.33 over 7 years
k) Notes – None


4. Document Management
a) System type – Document Management
b) Supplier name – In House Development
c) System name – DMS
d) Date installed - 2017
e) Contract expiration – N/A
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - No
h) Procurement framework – n/a
i) Other systems it integrates with? – WPAS,WCCG
j) Total value of contract (£) – N/A
k) Notes - None

5. E-Rostering (staffing)
a) System type – E-rostering
b) Supplier name – Allocate 
c) System name – Medic on Duty/Allocate 
d) Date installed - 2021
e) Contract expiration – 2023/2026
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - No
h) Procurement framework – A direct award was made through the STA process
i) Other systems it integrates with? – ESR
j) Total value of contract (£) – £85,000/£249,904
k) Notes – none

6. Laboratory Information Management System

a) System type – Pathology LIMS
b) Supplier name – Digital Health and Care Wales (DHCW) on an All Wales basis
c) System name – LIMS
d) Date installed – *
e) Contract expiration – *
f) Is this contract annually renewed? – * 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? – * 
h) Procurement framework – *
i) Other systems it integrates with? – * 
j) Total value of contract (£) – *  
k) Notes – *

* Swansea Bay Health Board does not hold this information. The system is procured on an All Wales basis by DHCW. May we suggest that you contact DHCW on DHCW.FOI@wales.nhs.uk who may be able to provide you with the information you require.


7. Pathology PACS
a) System type – Pathology LIMS
b) Supplier name - Intersystems
c) System name – Trakcare L2016
d) Date installed - 2015
e) Contract expiration - 2025
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes
h) Procurement framework – procured nationally as all wales system by DCHW
i) Other systems it integrates with? – *
j) Total value of contract (£) – *
k) Notes - tender – 5 year contract extension

* Swansea Bay Health Board does not hold this information. The system is procured on an All Wales basis by DHCW. May we suggest that you contact DHCW on DHCW.FOI@wales.nhs.uk who may be able to provide you with the information you require.

8. Pharmacy
a) System type – Pharmacy Stock Management System
b) Supplier name - Careflow
c) System name – Wellsky 
d) Date installed – 27/08/21
e) Contract expiration – 26/08/24 (Support contract)
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - No
h) Procurement framework - *
i) Other systems it integrates with? Welsh Master Patient Index System, Omnicell (robot
and cabinet systems) BD (robot system) Medecator (3rd party online ordering system)
j) Total value of contract (£) – *
k) Notes - None

* Swansea Bay Health Board does not hold this information. The system is procured on an All Wales basis by DHCW. May we suggest that you contact DHCW on DHCW.FOI@wales.nhs.uk who may be able to provide you with the information you require.

9. Sexual Health
a) System type – Millsystem
b) Supplier name – Millsystem now gone into liquidation 
c) System name - Millsystem
d) Date installed – Unsure 
e) Contract expiration – Now supported by Dedalus. Contract ends February 2025
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes
h) Procurement framework - * Awaiting introduction of All Wales System
i) Other systems it integrates with? – Lablink
j) Total value of contract (£) – *£17,641.80 +VAT
k) Notes 

* Swansea Bay Health Board does not hold this information. The system is procured on an All Wales basis by DHCW. May we suggest that you contact DHCW on DHCW.FOI@wales.nhs.uk who may be able to provide you with the information you require.

10. Theatres
a) System type – Theatres 
b) Supplier name – In House Built 
c) System name – TOMS
d) Date installed – June 2013
e) Contract expiration – N/A
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - No
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? – No 	
h) Procurement framework – n/a
i) Other systems it integrates with? - WPAS
j) Total value of contract (£) – N/A
k) Notes – None 
_____________________________________________________________ 



[bookmark: _Hlk168407067][bookmark: _Hlk168407068]
[image: A rainbow colored lines on a black background

Description automatically generated]Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol Bae Abertawe yw enw gweithredu Bwrdd Iechyd Lleol Prifysgol Bae Abertawe
Swansea Bay University Health Board is the operational name of Swansea Bay University Local Health Board
					

[image: ]gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser
 caring for each other, working together, always improving	Page 2

image6.jpeg
Bwrdd lechyd Prifysgol
Bae Abertawe

Swansea Bay University
Health Board





image5.jpg




image7.png




