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gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser
 caring for each other, working together, always improving

	
    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 24-A-083 






You asked:
Could you please answer the following:

1. Do(es) your hospital(s) have a solution to eliminate pathogens from the air?

Not routinely, however a trial/evaluation of a product in use taking place. 

1.1	In which departments? two surgical wards.
		
1.2	In which rooms? Throughout both ward areas.

1.3	What technology(ies) are in use?: NA
· Air circulation with Ultra Violet (UV)			
· Air Circulation with Air Filter			
· Air Circulation with Air Filter and UV		
· HVAC with UV						
· HVAC without UV					

1.4 Other (Which technology?)		
An air purification system is being evaluated on two wards.		


2. Do(es) your hospital(s) have a solution to eliminate pathogens from the surfaces? 
Cleaning & disinfection products.
		
2.1  	In which departments?
		ALL departments 

2.2	 In which rooms?
Surface disinfectant wipes and chlorine-based solutions  – all wards/department
2.3	What technology(ies) are in use to kill pathogens?:
UV-C

What wavelength? 254nm.

· In which areas of the hospital?

All wards/departments. 

· Antimicrobial coating - 

No.

· Which coating materials?  

Product evaluation of an antimicrobial nanolayer.

· In which areas of the hospital? 

Evaluation in two surgical wards.

· Antimicrobial cleaning products  

All Wards/Departments.

· Which chemicals?	

Neutral detergent solutions, peracetic acid, combined detergent & chlorine-releasing solutions, quaternary compounds.

· In which areas of the hospital?

All areas.

· Antimicrobial materials	
No.

· Which materials?
N/A.

· In which areas of the hospital?

N/A.

· HVAC with UV

No.

· HVAC without UV
[bookmark: _GoBack]No.

2.4 Other (Which technology?)  - 
None	

3.	What are the three most important areas to have a solution to kill pathogens from the air?
Locations where ventilation is inadequate and airborne pathogen risk exists.

4.	What are the three most important areas to have a solution to kill pathogens from the surfaces?
	Areas where vulnerable, immunocompromised patients receive care and/or  those with infectious symptoms present.

5.		Which department(s) / professional(s) make(s) the procurement decisions regarding solutions to kill pathogens from the air?
Infection Prevention and Control (IPC), Health & Safety, Estates & Facilities & Procurement.

6.		Which department(s) / professional(s) make(s) the procurement decisions regarding solutions to kill pathogens from the surfaces?
Infection Prevention and Control (IPC), Health & Safety, Estates & Facilities & Procurement.

7.	Do you have an Infection Prevention and Control department or is(are) designated members of staff managing it?
		Yes, there is an Infection Prevention Control department.

8.	 Are you planning to purchase a solution to kill pathogens from the air             in the next 
· 12 months?
· 24 months?
[bookmark: _Hlk158987464]This information is not recorded by the Health Board.  The right of access created by the Freedom of Information Act only applies to recorded information, the Health Board is under no obligation to divulge its unrecorded thoughts or opinions which your question is referring to.  It is therefore not a valid request under FOIA. 
9.	Are you planning to purchase a solution to kill pathogens from the surfaces on the next 
· 12 months?
· 24 months?
This information is not recorded by the Health Board.  The right of access created by the Freedom of Information Act only applies to recorded information, the Health Board is under no obligation to divulge its unrecorded thoughts or opinions which your question is referring to.  It is therefore not a valid request under FOIA. 
10.	Are you planning to purchase a solution to improve clinician hand hygiene on the next
· 12 months?
· 24 months?
This information is not recorded by the Health Board.  The right of access created by the Freedom of Information Act only applies to recorded information, the Health Board is under no obligation to divulge its unrecorded thoughts or opinions which your question is referring to.  It is therefore not a valid request under FOIA.

11.	What are your Infection Prevention and control targets for the next five years (Ex.: reduce number of Hospital Acquired Infections reductions by x% (n), increase clinicians hands hygiene rate by x%, reduce pathogens levels from the air in patient areas by x%, reduce pathogens levels from the air in public areas by x%, reduce pathogens levels from the surfaces in patient areas by x%, reduce pathogens levels from the surfaces in public areas by x%...)
Welsh Government sets annual healthcare associated infection reduction goals for all NHS Wales Health Boards and Trusts (https://www.gov.wales/sites/default/files/publications/2023-08/amr-hcai-improvement-goals-for-2023-24.pdf)

___________________________________________________________ 
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