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    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 24-B-009






You asked:

Under Freedom of Information, I would like to request the following information; 
In her forward in the NHS Wales Planning Framework 2022 – 2025 document (attached), Health Minister, Eluned Morgan says “My priorities recognise that as a country we must continue to respond to the immediate challenges of Covid, whilst also turning our attention to longer-term sustainability and improving population health We must invest in recovery, tackle health inequalities, improve mental health provision by giving parity between physical and mental health conditions, and focus on prevention. I am deeply committed to supporting our health and care workers who have been and remain at the forefront of our efforts.“  
I have looked at three recent NICE Technology Appraisal Guidance to see how their implementation across Wales has been enacted. Whilst much is made of social depravation as a cause of health inequalities, I thought it might be interesting to see if the actions of health boards in providing funding and resource for the technology appraised within two months of publication as per guidance. 
In each case regarding implementation, section 4.2 states;  
The Welsh ministers have issued directions to the NHS in Wales on implementing NICE technology appraisal guidance. When a NICE technology appraisal guidance recommends the use of a drug or treatment, or other technology, the NHS in Wales must usually provide funding and resources for it within 2 months of the first publication of the final draft guidance. 
The three I have looked at are; 
· Rimegepant for treating migraine (TA919) published 18 October 2023 
· Daridorexant for treating long-term insomnia (TA922) published 18 October 2023 
· Tirzepatide for treating Type 2 diabetes (TA924) published 25 October 2023 
All three of these were published more than 2 months ago, and so should all be readily available for patients to access. All three conditions are routinely managed in primary care with little or no involvement from secondary care, except in exceptional or difficult circumstances.  
Note that Rimegepant is indicated for treatment of both acute migraine and prophylaxis of migraine. As prophylaxis of migraine may be more routinely managed in secondary care, and treatment of acute migraine more routinely managed in primary care, I have focused these questions on the treatment of acute migraine only. 
Rimegepant for treating migraine 
Technology appraisal guidance [TA919] Published 18 October 2023 
Swansea Bay UHB Inform https://abmformulary.wales.nhs.uk/ section 04.07.04.01 - Treatment of acute migraine has Rimegepant listed as red, ie, RED (H) - Hospital use only.  
Cardiff & Vale UHB inform https://cavformulary.wales.nhs.uk/ section 
04.07.04.01 - Treatment of acute migraine has Rimegepant listed as green, ie, G  = General Use – all prescribers. 
Powys tHB Inform https://powformulary.wales.nhs.uk/ section 
04.07.04.01 - Treatment of acute migraine has Rimegepant listed as blue, ie, Second line medicines, all prescribers (second line to triptans, as per NICE TA919) 
Question 1.1 – Given that patients in Cardiff & Vale UHB and Powys tHB who are sat in front of their primary care GP, nurse or pharmacist suffering an acute migraine (provided they meet NICE criteria) can be prescribed Rimegepant by their primary care HCP, but a patient in Swansea Bay UHB sat in front of their primary care GP, nurse or pharmacist suffering an acute migraine (provided they meet NICE criteria) must be referred and put on a waiting list (6-12 months) to see a hospital physician to be prescribed Rimegepant, how do you justify and intend to rectify this health inequality? 
Rimegepant is prescribed hospital only for prophylaxis. Acute treatment would be via either Primary Care or Specialist Migraine Clinic as per https://abmformulary.wales.nhs.uk/ entry.
Question 1.2 – What are the job titles of the people in Swansea Bay UHB responsible for deciding that Rimegepant should be listed as red for acute migraine in Swansea Bay UHB and in which departments do they work? 
Terms of reference attached. 
Question 1.3 – What is the job title of the person responsible for outpatient waiting lists for Acute Migraine in Swansea Bay UHB and what involvement did they have in the decision to list Rimegepant as red? 
This information is not held. There is not one person in charge of outpatient waiting lists for Acute Migraine in the Health Board.
Question 1.4 – What is the current waiting time in Swansea Bay UHB for a patient referred by their GP with acute migraine to be seen in secondary care and not just reviewed, but for the patient to receive a prescription for acute migraine?
This information is not held centrally by the Health Board. 
Question 1.5 – How many patients in Swansea Bay UHB meet the criteria for Rimegepant, and if they were all referred to secondary care, (rather than treated by the GP/Practice Nurse/Pharmacist they were in front of suffering there and then with an acute migraine), what effect would this have on waiting lists, and how long would a patient have to wait to receive a prescription for Rimegepant? 
This information is not held centrally by the Health Board.
Question 1.6 – How could you engage primary care providers in Swansea Bay UHB to ensure that they can manage appropriate acute migraine patients in primary care with Rimegepant at the point when the patient presents in need of intervention? Would you expect primary care HCPs to just prescribe a new medication, or would there be training interventions from consultants in secondary care? 
This information is not recorded by the Health Board.  The right of access created by the Freedom of Information Act only applies to recorded information, the Health Board is under no obligation to divulge its unrecorded thoughts or opinions which your question is referring to.  It is therefore not a valid request under FOIA. 
Question 1.7 – How many prescriptions for Rimegepant were written in Swansea Bay UHB in 2023? 
I can confirm this data is not held by SBUHB. Prescription data is processed, held by NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership, and readily available in the public domain, published here:
https://nwssp.nhs.wales/ourservices/primary-care-services/general-information/data-and-publications/prescribing-data-extracts/
There are no issues of Rimegepant in secondary care held on the hospital pharmacy system.  
Question 1.8 – For the last 12 month period for which you have data, how many patients presented to A&E with migraine, how many patients presented to SDEC with migraine and how many presented to out of hours with migraine? 
	Location
	Attendances
	Individual patients

	A&E (Morriston ED & Neath PT MIU)
	255
	248

	SDEC (Morriston - SDEC ward)
	24
	24



SDEC admissions are based on admitting primary diagnosis i.e. main reason for admission.
Question 1.9 – Will you please provide me with a copy of the minutes of the meeting at which it was decided to list Rimegepant as RED (H) - Hospital use only? 
No minutes available as Rimegepant is not listed as RED (H) as per https://abmformulary.wales.nhs.uk/ entry.
Question 1.10 – Do you consider primary care prescribers in Swansea Bay too stupid to prescribe a simple and straightforward migraine treatment, or is there some other reason you prevent them from prescribing medicine to patients in pain, when primary care prescribers in other health boards can? If so, what is this other reason? It can’t be money, as NICE TA shows that the intervention is cost effective and must be made available. What is the real reason to keep your patients suffering the pain of migraine? Are you deliberately putting pressure on secondary care services in the hope that they will fail? Is this political? 
This information is not recorded by the Health Board.  The right of access created by the Freedom of Information Act only applies to recorded information, the Health Board is under no obligation to divulge its unrecorded thoughts or opinions which your question is referring to.  It is therefore not a valid request under FOIA. 
However, the aim of the Health Board’s medicines formulary is to promote safe, rational, and cost-effective prescribing. Formulary decisions are based solely on available clinical and cost-effectiveness evidence. The formulary status of any given medicine is periodically reviewed and can be subsequently revised to make it more available to prescribe to a wider range of clinicians. There is no political input into formulary.

Daridorexant for treating long-term insomnia 
Technology appraisal guidance [TA922] Published: 18 October 2023 
 
Swansea Bay UHB Inform https://abmformulary.wales.nhs.uk/ section 04.99 – Other Central Nervous System has Daridorexant listed as blue, ie, BLUE (2nd) – Drug is on formulary and is the 2nd line choice. 
Cwm Taf & Vale UHB Inform https://cttformulary.wales.nhs.uk/ section 04.99 – Other Central Nervous System has Daridorexant listed as green, ie, G  = General Use – all prescribers. 
 
Question 2.1 – Given that a patient in Cwm Taf & Vale UHB who is sat in front of their primary care GP, nurse or pharmacist suffering from long-term insomnia (provided they meet NICE criteria) can be prescribed Daridorexant by their primary care HCP, but a patient in Swansea Bay UHB sat in front of their primary care GP, nurse or pharmacist suffering from long-term insomnia (provided they meet NICE criteria) must be referred and put on a waiting list (6-12 months) to see a hospital physician to be prescribed another medication listed as RED (H) - Hospital use only, before Daridorexant can be prescribed in primary care, how do you justify and intend to rectify this health inequality? 
Daridorexant is the first drug in a new class for the treatment of insomnia. It has MHRA 'black triangle' status - https://www.gov.uk/drug-safety-update/the-black-triangle-scheme-or Most 'black triangle' drugs are initially listed as hospital-only prescribing until sufficient specialist experience with the drug has been built up to allow for the safe and effective transfer of prescribing to primary care clinicians. 

Daridorexant is listed as BLUE (2nd) – Drug is on formulary and is the 2nd line choice as this is directly in accordance with NICE TA.

Question 2.2 – Is Daridorexant 2nd line only to those other drugs on the formulary, or is it also 2nd line to cognitive behavioural therapy for insomnia (CBTi)? 
Daridorexant is second line to CBTi.
Question 2.3 – Is Daridorexant available for both initiation in primary care, assuming it is 2nd line to some other intervention? 
Daridorexant is available for initiation in primary care. 
Question 2.4 – How many prescriptions for Daridorexant were written in Swansea Bay UHB in 2023? 
I can confirm this data is not held by SBUHB. Prescription data is processed, held by NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership, and readily available in the public domain, published here:
https://nwssp.nhs.wales/ourservices/primary-care-services/general-information/data-and-publications/prescribing-data-extracts/
There are no issues of Daridorexant in secondary care held on the hospital pharmacy system.  
Question 2.5 – Will you please provide me with a copy of the minutes of the meeting at which it was decided to list Daridorexant as BLUE (2nd) – Drug is on formulary and is the 2nd line choice? 
Daridorexant is listed as BLUE (2nd) – Drug is on formulary and is the 2nd line choice as this is directly in accordance with NICE TA therefore there are no minutes available. 
Question 2.6 – Do you consider primary care prescribers in Swansea Bay too stupid to prescribe a simple and straightforward insomnia treatment without first referring to secondary care, or is there some other reason you prevent them from prescribing medicine to patients in need, when primary care prescribers in other health boards can? If so, what is this other reason? It can’t be money, as NICE TA shows that the intervention is cost effective and must be made available. What is the real reason to keep your patients at increased risk of hypertension, diabetes, obesity, depression, heart attack and stroke? Are you deliberately putting pressure on secondary care services in the hope that they will fail? Is this political? 
This information is not recorded by the Health Board.  The right of access created by the Freedom of Information Act only applies to recorded information, the Health Board is under no obligation to divulge its unrecorded thoughts or opinions which your question is referring to.  It is therefore not a valid request under FOIA. 
However, the aim of the Health Board’s medicines formulary is to promote safe, rational, and cost-effective prescribing. Formulary decisions are based solely on available clinical and cost-effectiveness evidence. The formulary status of any given medicine is periodically reviewed and can be subsequently revised to make it more available to prescribe to a wider range of clinicians. There is no political input into formulary.

Tirzepatide for treating type 2 diabetes 
Technology appraisal guidance [TA924] Published: 25 October 2023 
 
Swansea Bay UHB Inform https://abmformulary.wales.nhs.uk/ section 06.01.02.03 GLP-1 Receptor Agonists. I can’t see Tirzepatide listed. 
 
Question 3.1 – More than two months has passed since TA924 was published, so why has it not been made available? 
Although the drug has a product licence and has received NICE approval, the manufacturer has not yet launched the drug in the UK and made supplies available. No prescriptions have been issued for Tirzepatide in Wales.
Question 3.2 – How many prescriptions for Tirzepatide were written in Swansea Bay UHB in 2023? 
See Q 3.1
[bookmark: _Hlk163563855]Question 3.3 – Will you please provide me with a copy of the minutes of the meeting at which it was decided not to list Tirzepatide on the formulary? 
Tirzepatide is listed on formulary as per https://abmformulary.wales.nhs.uk/, therefore there are no minutes available in relation to the question.
Question 3.4 – Do you consider primary care prescribers in Swansea Bay too stupid to prescribe a simple and straightforward diabetes treatment, or is there some other reason you prevent them from prescribing medicine to patients in need, when primary care prescribers in other health boards can? If so, what is this other reason? It can’t be money, as NICE TA shows that the intervention is cost effective and must be made available. What is the real reason to keep your patients at increased risk of a heart attack, stroke, amputation, blindness etc? Are you deliberately putting pressure on secondary care services in the hope that they will fail? Is this political? 
This information is not recorded by the Health Board.  The right of access created by the Freedom of Information Act only applies to recorded information, the Health Board is under no obligation to divulge its unrecorded thoughts or opinions which your question is referring to.  It is therefore not a valid request under FOIA. 
However, the aim of the Health Board’s medicines formulary is to promote safe, rational, and cost-effective prescribing. Formulary decisions are based solely on available clinical and cost-effectiveness evidence. The formulary status of any given medicine is periodically reviewed and can be subsequently revised to make it more available to prescribe to a wider range of clinicians. There is no political input a into formulary.
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