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  Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
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You asked:
Community Respiratory Service Mapping
1. Does your Health Board provide community-based bronchiectasis services?
Yes

2. Does your Health Board provide services dedicated to complex bronchiectasis e.g. those with frequent exacerbations, or comorbidities?
Yes

3. Does your Health Board provide community-based services treat complex respiratory conditions such as COPD, interstitial lung disease?
Yes
If yes, please complete the table below:
· Name of provider - SBUHB
· Number of patients contracted/treated in the past year	 
 I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. The majority of these patients are seen in a community setting where the information is not recorded digitally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.
High-cost drug propensity 
1. Are the community service providers authorised to treat patients with any of the following drug types?
· Monoclonal antibodies
No
· Nebulised or infusion polymyxins / aminoglycosides antibiotics e.g. Colomycin or Gentamicin
Yes 

· Other high-cost drugs 
No

Resource utilisation
1. What is the total resource funding utilisation in social care for exacerbating bronchiectasis, in the last financial year?
I can confirm that this information is not recorded. There are no dedicated staff for this condition therefore it is not possible to break this down by bronchiectasis only.

2. What/how much is funded from NHS budgets?
100% of service funding is from NHS budgets

3. What/how much is funded by social care budgets? 
None


_____________________________________________________________ 
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