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gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser
 caring for each other, working together, always improving

	
    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 23-I-019






You asked:
I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 about the care home Plas Cwm Carw, Oakwood Lane, Port Talbot. SA13 1DF.
Specifically, I would like to know the following:
1. Why the care home was placed under special measures and the issues associated with the intervention/findings.
This information is not held by the Health Board and would be held by the Neath Port Talbot Council as lead agency for the provider Management Process.
2. Staffing levels during the period of special measures, especially through Covid as I would like to understand how they performed against the optimum levels and how this varied during the special measures period.

This information is not held by the Health Board and would be held by the Neath Port Talbot Council as lead agency for the provider Management Process.
3. Any complaints received from other complainants.
I can confirm that the Health Board has not received any complaints in relation to this care home.
4. Whether neglect was an issue at any time
 Not applicable – see Q3.
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5. The impact that neglect would have had on the vulnerable residents especially during Covid.
This information is not recorded by the Health Board.  The right of access created by the Freedom of Information Act only applies to recorded information, the Health Board is under no obligation to divulge its unrecorded thoughts or opinions which your question is referring to.  It is therefore not a valid request under FOIA.    
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