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' N H S Swansea Bay University gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser
Health Board caring for each other, working together, always improving

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.
We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a
delay.

Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 23-F-016

You asked:

1. How many dental contracts have been handed back to the health board in
2022-2023?
None

2. How many notifications has the health board received about the intention of
a practice to hand back their contract or reduce their NHS obligations in

2022-2023?
In 2022-23 there were no SBU practices who either stopped providing or reduced
their provision of NHS general dental services.

During 2022-23, one GDS practice informed the Health Board of their intention to
cease NHS provision in 2023-24. A further GDS practice agreed with the Health Board
to reduce their NHS contract value from 2023-24.

3. How many practicing GDPs are there in the local health board area?
There are currently 52 dental practices in the Swansea Bay University Health Board
area who provide NHS general dental services. The Health Board does not hold
information relating to the number of practising GDPs.

4. What is the FTE of the number of GDPs practicing in the area?
This information is not held.
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