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    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 23-G-063






You asked:
1. Please provide the names of the providers of each service (on-call and elective separately please)?
a. Start date, duration and end date of any contracts with teleradiology providers?
b. Can the contract be extended and how long for?
c. When do you start looking at the contract before expires? 
d. Which framework do you use for teleradiology services? 
a. NHS supply chain 
b. Shared Business Services (SBS)
c. Health Health Board Europe (HTE) 
d. East of England NHS CPH (EOECPH)
e. North of England CPC
f. Other  
I can confirm that SBUHB do not hold this information. These contracts are procured on a national basis by NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership (NWSSP) who may be able to assist you with the information you require. You can contact them on shared.services@wales.nhs.uk
2. What is the usual procurement process for teleradiology services, and is it typically carried out as part of an Integrated Care System (ICS) or through the respective Health Board?
I can confirm that SBUHB do not hold this information. These contracts are procured on a national basis by NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership (NWSSP) who may be able to assist you with the information you require. You can contact them on shared.services@wales.nhs.uk

3. Who deals with the procurement of contracts for teleradiology?
I can confirm that SBUHB do not hold this information. These contracts are procured on a national basis by NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership (NWSSP) who may be able to assist you with the information you require. You can contact them on shared.services@wales.nhs.uk

4. [bookmark: _GoBack]Please provide the name and contact details of the Clinical Director for Radiology 
Dr Sean Evans – Clinical Director and Consultant Radiologist
Sean.Evans6@wales.nhs.uk 

5. Please provide the name and contact details of the General Manager for Radiology
Elizabeth Humphries - Deputy Directorate Manager, CSS Radiology & Critical Care
Elizabeth.M.Humphries@wales.nhs.uk 

6. Please provide the name and contact details of the Service manager for Radiology
Alexandra Simmonds - Radiology Services Manager
Alexandra.Simmonds@wales.nhs.uk 
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