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gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser
 caring for each other, working together, always improving

	
    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 23-G-009






You asked:
Please may I request the following information from your health board? For ease of collation, the information could be provided in the tables provided after each question. 

1. The numbers of patients who have been prescribed antidepressants in the following years after a phone consultation. 

	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023 (SO FAR)

	
	
	
	
	
	



I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

1. The numbers of patients who have been prescribed antidepressants in the following years after one GP consultation regarding their mental health. 

	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023 (SO FAR)

	
	
	
	
	
	



[bookmark: _GoBack]I can confirm that this information is not held by the health board. This information may be held by the individual GP practices, please contact them directly.

1. Can I also confirm if there is a method by which the NHS tracks side effects experienced from use of these drugs? 
Antidepressants in this instance refers to any of the following classifications of drugs: SSRIs, SNRIs, NASSAs, TCAs, SARIs, MAOIs.
Side effects from medications are tracked and recorded by the Yellow Card Scheme on a national basis. You can find more information here - https://yellowcard.mhra.gov.uk/ 


_____________________________________________________________ 
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