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    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 23-G-006






You asked:
1. How many NHS registered dental practices were there in 2013?
There were 65 contracts providing NHS services from 54 dental practices in 2013.

2. How many NHS registered dental practices were there in 2023?
There are 58 contracts providing NHS services from 53 dental practices in 2023.

3. How many NHS registered dentists were there in 2013?
There were 235 dentists on the NHS Performers list for Swansea/NPT in 2013

4. How many NHS registered dentists were there in 2023?
There are 217 dentists on the NHS Performers list for Swansea Bay UHB in 2023.

5. How many NHS registered dental patients were there in 2013?
There is no registration process for NHS dental patients

6. How many NHS registered dental patients were there in 2023?
There is no registration process for NHS dental patients

7. How many NHS registered dental patients were there in 2013 on a waiting list for treatment?
I can confirm that this information is not held centrally by the Health Board. Each practice holds their own waiting lists and you will need to contact them for this information.

8. How many NHS registered dental patients were there in 2023 on a waiting list for treatment?
[bookmark: _GoBack]I can confirm that this information is not held centrally by the Health Board. Each practice holds their own waiting lists and you will need to contact them for this information.
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Pencadlys BIP Bae Abertawe, Un Porthfa Talbot, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR / Swansea Bay UHB Headquarters, One Talbot Gateway, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR
Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol Bae Abertawe yw enw gweithredu Bwrdd Iechyd Lleol Prifysgol Bae Abertawe
Swansea Bay University Health Board is the operational name of Swansea Bay University Local Health Board
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