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Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.
We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a
delay.

Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 23-A-040

You asked:

1. Do you use Teleradiology services?

I can confirm that the information you are seeking is held on our Disclosure Log on
our website. Under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act (information
accessible by other means), we are not required to provide information in response
to a request if the information is already reasonably accessible to you. May I
therefore recommend that you look at this link to our disclosure log, which contains
details of where you can obtain the information you require:
https://sbuhb.nhs.wales/files/freedom-of-information-disclosure-log-
2022/october/22-j-033-outsourced-radiology/

2. Do you have a contract with an external provider of Teleradiology Services
and, if so, which companies are the contract with?
I can confirm that the information you are seeking is held on our Disclosure Log on
our website. Under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act (information
accessible by other means), we are not required to provide information in response
to a request if the information is already reasonably accessible to you. May I
therefore recommend that you look at this link to our disclosure log, which contains
details of where you can obtain the information you require:
https://sbuhb.nhs.wales/files/freedom-of-information-disclosure-log-
2022/october/22-j-033-outsourced-radiology/

3. Start date, duration and end date of any contracts with tele-radiology
providers?
I can confirm that the information you are seeking is held on our Disclosure Log on
our website. Under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act (information
accessible by other means), we are not required to provide information in response
to a request if the information is already reasonably accessible to you. May I
therefore recommend that you look at this link to our disclosure log, which contains
details of where you can obtain the information you require:
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Can the contract be extended and for how long?

I can confirm that the information you are seeking is held on our Disclosure Log on
our website. Under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act (information
accessible by other means), we are not required to provide information in response
to a request if the information is already reasonably accessible to you. May I
therefore recommend that you look at this link to our disclosure log, which contains
details of where you can obtain the information you require:
https://sbuhb.nhs.wales/files/freedom-of-information-disclosure-log-
2022/october/22-j-033-outsourced-radiology/

What is the Annual spend on teleradiology providers in financial years
2020, 2021 and 2022 (or as available) by each provider?

2020/21 - I can confirm that the information you are seeking is held on our
Disclosure Log on our website. Under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act
(information accessible by other means), we are not required to provide information
in response to a request if the information is already reasonably accessible to you.
May I therefore recommend that you look at this link to our disclosure log, which
contains details of where you can obtain the information you require:
https://sbuhb.nhs.wales/files/freedom-of-information-disclosure-log-2021/may/21-
e-031-teleradiology-services/

2021/22 - £213,297.91

Are the current providers meeting their turnaround times?
Not always

When do you start the tendering process when the contract is due to
expire?

I can confirm that SBU Health Board does not hold this information. May I
recommend that you contact the NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership (NWSSP)
who procure services on behalf of Health Boards in Wales:

shared.services@wales.nhs.uk.

Did you procure the Teleradiology services via a tender process?

I can confirm that SBU Health Board does not hold this information. May I
recommend that you contact the NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership (NWSSP)
who procure services on behalf of Health Boards in Wales:

shared.services@wales.nhs.uk

Which framework do you use for teleradiology services?

I can confirm that SBU Health Board does not hold this information. May I
recommend that you contact the NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership (NWSSP)
who procure services on behalf of Health Boards in Wales:

shared.services@wales.nhs.uk
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Does the Health Board have a backlog of X-Ray, CT and MRI scans? If so
how many?
Yes. Plain film — 1292, MRI - 328 and CT scans - 288

Does the Health Board expect the usage of teleradiology services to
increase in the next 3 years?
No

Who deals with the procurement of contracts for teleradiology?

I can confirm that SBU Health Board does not hold this information. May I
recommend that you contact the NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership (NWSSP)
who procure services on behalf of Health Boards in Wales:

shared.services@wales.nhs.uk

Please provide the name and contact details of the procurement manager
who deals with teleradiology contracts

I can confirm that SBU Health Board does not hold this information. May I
recommend that you contact the NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership (NWSSP)
who procure services on behalf of Health Boards in Wales:

shared.services@wales.nhs.uk

Please provide the name and contact details of the Clinical Director for
Radiology

I can confirm that the information you are seeking is held on our Disclosure Log on
our website. Under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act (information
accessible by other means), we are not required to provide information in response
to a request if the information is already reasonably accessible to you. May I
therefore recommend that you look at this link to our disclosure log, which contains
details of where you can obtain the information you require:
https://sbuhb.nhs.wales/files/freedom-of-information-disclosure-log-2021/may/21-
e-031-teleradiology-services/

Please provide the name and contact details of the General Manager for
Radiology

I can confirm that the information you are seeking is held on our Disclosure Log on
our website. Under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act (information
accessible by other means), we are not required to provide information in response
to a request if the information is already reasonably accessible to you. May I
therefore recommend that you look at this link to our disclosure log, which contains
details of where you can obtain the information you require:
https://sbuhb.nhs.wales/files/freedom-of-information-disclosure-log-2021/may/21-
e-031-teleradiology-services/

Please provide the name and contact details of the Service manager for
Radiology

I can confirm that the information you are seeking is held on our Disclosure Log on
our website. Under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act (information
accessible by other means), we are not required to provide information in response
to a request if the information is already reasonably accessible to you. May I
therefore recommend that you look at this link to our disclosure log, which contains
details of where you can obtain the information you require:
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