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gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser 

 caring for each other, working together, always improving 

    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  

We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a 

delay. 

 

 

You clarified on 12th April 2023 that you are looking for assaults by patients, 

members of the public and other staff on SBUHB staff members. 

You further clarified that “Assaults involving medical factors” refers to the number of 

physical assaults where the perpetrator did not know what they were doing, or did 

not know what they were doing was wrong due to medical illness, mental ill health, 

severe learning disability or treatment administered, if noted. 

 

You asked: 

1. The total number of physical assaults on staff recorded in 2021/22 and 

2022/23 (financial years from April 1 to March 31) 

Please note that this includes slipping, biting, grabbing and spitting. 

2021-22 507 

2022-23 575 

 

2. The total number of physical assaults on staff recorded that involved 

medical factors in  2021/22 and 2022/23 (financial years from April 1 to 

March 31). 

I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information 

would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated 

would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the 

reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and 

Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are 

not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, 

retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for 

information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.  

 

 

3. The total number of times physical injury to staff was recorded following 

physical assaults in 2021/22 and 2022/23 (financial years from April 1 to 

March 31). If possible, please break down the number of injuries reported 

by severe/major, moderate, and low/minor. 

Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request 
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 23-D-015 
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I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information 

would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated 

would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the 

reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and 

Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are 

not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, 

retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for 

information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.  

 

4. The total number of times restraint was used on a service user/patient 

following a physical assault on staff in 2021/22 and 2022/23 (financial 

years from April 1 to March 31). 

I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information 

would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated 

would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the 

reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and 

Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are 

not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, 

retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for 

information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

 

5. The total number of times was seclusion used on a service user/patient 

following a physical assault on staff in 2021/22 and 2022/23 (financial 

years from April 1 to March 31). 

I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information 

would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated 

would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the 

reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and 

Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are 

not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, 

retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for 

information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

 

6. Total number of criminal sanctions applied in relation to physical assaults 

on staff in 2021/22 and 2022/23 (financial years from April 1 to March 

31). 

I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information 

would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated 

would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the 

reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and 

Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are 

not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, 

retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for 

information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 
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7. Total number of civil and administrative sanctions applied in relation to 

physical assaults on staff in 2021/22 and 2022/23 (financial years from 

April 1 to March 31). 

I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information 

would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated 

would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the 

reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and 

Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are 

not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, 

retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for 

information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

 

 

8. The total number of times intended police action in relation to physical 

assaults on staff was recorded as charge  in 2021/22 and 2022/23 

(financial years from April 1 to March 31) 

I can confirm that the health board does not hold this information. You will need to 

contact South Wales Police who may be able to assist you further. 

 

 

9. The total number of times intended police action in relation to physical 

assaults on staff was recorded as verbal warning in 2021/22 and 

2022/23 (financial years from April 1 to March 31) 

I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information 

would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated 

would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the 

reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and 

Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are 

not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, 

retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for 

information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

 

 

10. The total number of times intended police action in relation to physical 

assaults on staff was recorded as no action in 2021/22 and 2022/23 

(financial years from April 1 to March 31) 

I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information 

would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated 

would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the 

reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and 

Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are 

not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, 

retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for 

information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

 

 

11. The total number of times it was recorded that the victim did not want 

police to pursue the matter in relation to physical assaults on staff in  

2021/22 and 2022/23 (financial years from April 1 to March 31) 
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I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information 

would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated 

would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the 

reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and 

Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are 

not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, 

retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for 

information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.  

 

 

_____________________________________________________________  

 


