
  

  

 
 

Pencadlys BIP Bae Abertawe, Un Porthfa Talbot, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR / Swansea Bay UHB Headquarters, One Talbot 

Gateway, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR 

Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol Bae Abertawe yw enw gweithredu Bwrdd Iechyd Lleol Prifysgol Bae Abertawe 

Swansea Bay University Health Board is the operational name of Swansea Bay University Local Health Board 

  

Cadeirydd/Chair: Emma Woollett 

Prif Weithredwr/Chief Executive: Mark Hackett 

 

gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser 

 caring for each other, working together, always improving 

    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  

We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a 

delay. 

 

 

 

You asked: 

1. The number of Scaphoid injuries awaiting treatment by SBUHB in the 

‘trauma’ pathway at 1st January 2020  

17 patients were awaiting a procedure 

 

2. The number of Scaphoid injuries awaiting treatment by SBUHB in the 

‘trauma’ pathway at 29th September 2022  

44 patients were awaiting a procedure 

 

3. The number of clinicians employed by SBUHB who are able to operate 

and treat this injury  

3 Trauma & Orthopaedics consultants are commissioned to treat this injury. 

 

4. The number of clinicians employed by SBUHB who also practice 

privately  

You clarified on 31st October 2022 that you are referring to all clinicians, not 

just those who can operate on Scaphoid injuries. 

 

I can confirm that SBUHB does not hold this information.  

 

5. The number of Scaphoid injuries that have been treated by SBUHB 

clinicians in the 2022 calendar year to date (1st Jan 2022 to 29th 

September 2022) 

10 patients have been admitted in the specified period with a scaphoid fracture 

either in the secondary or primary admission position.  

 

6. The number of patients who have been removed from the list, and 

have elected to pay for private treatment 

I can confirm that SBUHB does not hold this information. 

 

_____________________________________________________________ 

Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request 
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 22-J-048 

 

 

 


