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gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser 

 caring for each other, working together, always improving 

    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  

We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a 

delay. 

 

 

 

You asked: 

1. Does the Health Board make use of outsourced tele-radiology reporting 

services for routine radiology reporting? 

Yes 

 

2. If you do make use of tele-radiology reporting, please provide the 

names of the providers of each service (on-call and elective separately 

please)? 

Everlight 

 

3. If you do make use of tele-radiology reporting services, please provide 

the annual volumes for both 2021 and for 2022 sent to each provider, 

broken into the following: 

• Overnight on-call 

• Elective Reporting (MRI, CT) 

• Plain Film Reporting 

• Split into each hospital within the Health Board 

 

Please note that this information is not held by hospital. It is recorded on a 

Health Board basis only by Financial Year.  

SBUHB do not outsource Plain Film Reporting. 

 

Year CT MRI 

Routine Out of Hours Routine Out of Hours   

21-22 1093 766 355 190   

22-23 1826 902 1883 336   

 

4. Start date, duration and end date of any contracts with tele-radiology 

providers? 

Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request 
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 22-J-033 
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I can confirm that SBUHB do not hold this information. These contracts are 

procured on a national basis by NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership 

(NWSSP) who may be able to assist you with the information you require. You 

can contact them on shared.services@wales.nhs.uk  

 

5. Was the contract procured via a framework (direct award, which 

framework?), mini-tender, or ITT procurement process? 

I can confirm that SBUHB do not hold this information. These contracts are 

procured on a national basis by NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership 

(NWSSP) who may be able to assist you with the information you require. You 

can contact them on shared.services@wales.nhs.uk 

 

6. Who is the senior officer (outside of procurement) responsible for this 

contract? 

I can confirm that SBUHB do not hold this information. These contracts are 

procured on a national basis by NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership 

(NWSSP) who may be able to assist you with the information you require. You 

can contact them on shared.services@wales.nhs.uk 

 

7. Who is the non clinical manager/service manager that is responsible 

for this contract? 

Alexandra Simmonds – Radiology Service Manager 

 

_____________________________________________________________  

 

mailto:shared.services@wales.nhs.uk
mailto:shared.services@wales.nhs.uk
mailto:shared.services@wales.nhs.uk

