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Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.
We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a
delay.

Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 22-G-014

You asked:
I would like to request information for the following hospitals:
- Singleton and Morriston Hospitals

- Morriston Hospital - Paediatrics
- Neath Port Talbot Hospital

Q1) Who is the current Endoscopy lead for your Endoscopy Management System?

Full Name Elizabeth Champion
Email Elizabeth.Champion@wales.nhs.uk
Phone 01639 683624

Q2) Who is your Endoscopy Service Manager for the Department?

Full Name Samantha Victor
Email Samantha.Victor@wales.nhs.uk
Phone 01639 862123

Q3) Who is your current Endoscopy reporting software provider?

Answer Medilogik

Pencadlys BIP Bae Abertawe, Un Porthfa Talbot, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR / Swansea Bay UHB Headquarters, One Talbot
Gateway, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR
Bwrdd lechyd Prifysgol Bae Abertawe yw enw gweithredu Bwrdd lechyd Lleol Prifysgol Bae Abertawe
Swansea Bay University Health Board is the operational name of Swansea Bay University Local Health Board
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Q4) How long is your current contract and when will that contract expire?

Answer

2 years. Renewing in Autumn 2022.

Q5) What functionality would make you move to a new system?

Answer

This information is not recorded by the Health Board. The right of
access created by the Freedom of Information Act only applies to
recorded information, the Health Board is under no obligation to divulge
its unrecorded thoughts or opinions which your question is referring to.
It is therefore not a valid request under FOIA.

Q6) Is NEDi2 & JAG Accreditation important to your department?

Answer

Yes

Q7) Do you prefer software installed onsite or in the cloud?

Answer

This information is not recorded by the Health Board. The right of
access created by the Freedom of Information Act only applies to
recorded information, the Health Board is under no obligation to divulge
its unrecorded thoughts or opinions which your question is referring to.
It is therefore not a valid request under FOIA.

Q8) Do you run Endoscopy services from multiple sites?

Answer

Yes

Q9) Do you have a department scheduling/booking system?

Answer

Yes

Q10) Do you currently purchase through a framework, direct award or tender
your software requirements?

Answer

Previous exercise was undertaken as a competitive tender.
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Please add additional information or comments that you feel will help respond to
this request.

Additional
Information
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