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I refer to your Freedom of Information Act Request acknowledged by ourselves on 28th January 2022.  Your request sought information relating to dental waiting lists.
1. What is the length of time people are having to wait to register onto a waiting list at NHS dental surgeries that come under the Swansea Bay University Health Board? We would like month-by-month figures for 2021, compared with 2020. 
I can confirm that Swansea Bay Health Board does not hold this information. This would be held by the individual dental practices.

2. What is the length of time that people are having to wait for routine check-ups at NHS dental surgeries that come under the Swansea Bay University Health Board? We would like month-by-month figures for 2021, compared with 2020. 
I can confirm that Swansea Bay Health Board does not hold this information. This would be held by the individual dental practices.

3. What is the length of time that people are having to wait for surgery and or operations at NHS dental surgeries that come under the Swansea Bay University Health Board?  We would like month-by-month figures for 2021, compared with 2020. 
I can confirm that Swansea Bay Health Board does not hold this information. This would be held by the individual dental practices.

4. How many dentists left their position at dental surgeries that come under the Swansea Bay University Health Board in 2020 and 2021? And were their roles filled?
I can confirm that Swansea Bay Health Board does not hold this information. This would be held by the individual dental practices.
General workforce information can be found on the StatsWales data website https://statswales.gov.wales/Catalogue/Health-and-Social-Care/General-Dental-Services/Current-Contract/nhsdentalworkforce-by-localhealthboard-agegroup-contracttype-gender-dentisttype-year 

5. What is the full capacity of dentists you need within your health board?
Dental Contracts in Wales are commissioned on an activity basis. Dental contract holders employ the required workforce to enable them to deliver against the required activity.

6. What is the current number of dentists you have within the health board?
The SBUHB Dental Performers list is held by NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership (NWSSP). May I suggest you contact Tim Knifton, Information Governance Manager for NWSSP who may be able to assist you with this information on shared.services@wales.nhs.uk 


I hope this information is helpful. If you require anything further please contact us at FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk. 
Under the terms of the Health Board’s Freedom of Information policy, individuals seeking access to recorded information held by the Health Board are entitled to request internal review of the handling of their requests. If you would like to complain about the Health Board’s handling of your request please contact me directly at the address below or register your complaint via FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk. 
If after Internal Review you remain dissatisfied you are also entitled to refer the matter to the information commissioner at the Information Commissioner’s Office (Wales), 2nd Floor, Churchill House, Churchill Way, Cardiff, CF10 2HH. Telephone Number: 0330 414 6421.  
Yours sincerely
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Hazel Lloyd
Interim Director of Corporate Governance
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Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol Bae Abertawe yw enw gweithredu Bwrdd Iechyd Lleol Prifysgol Bae Abertawe
Swansea Bay University Health Board is the operational name of Swansea Bay University Local Health Board
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