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I refer to your Freedom of Information Act Request acknowledged by ourselves on 25.01.22.  Your request sought information relating to adverse reactions and the COVID-19 vaccine.

Please note that from 1st April 2019 responsibility for providing healthcare services for people in the Bridgend County Borough Council area transferred from Abertawe Bro Morgannwg University Health Board to Cwm Taf Morgannwg University Health Board. In light of this change to ABMU’s responsibilities, the organisation’s name has changed to Swansea Bay University Health Board.
Therefore this response takes into account these changes and any information relating to the Bridgend area, will now be held by Cwm Taf Morgannwg University Health Board.  
1. Please will you indicate how many reports have been made to the VAERS system by these hospitals from 1 December 2020 to date?
You clarified on 28th January 2022 that “VAERS System” refers to the Yellow Card System for reporting adverse vaccine reactions.

The Health Board does not hold this information. Adverse reactions would be reported through the yellow card system via The Medicines and Healthcare products Regulatory Agency (MRHA) https://coronavirus-yellowcard.mhra.gov.uk

2. For comparison purposes, please will you provide annualised data regarding the number of recorded falls in patients of 40 years and over in 2019, 2020, 2021 and 2022 to date.
You clarified on 28th January 2022 that you are referring to falls outside hospital, in the patient’s home and in the community.

Please note that we have provided the number of patients aged 40 and over that have attended our Minor Injuries Unit at Neath Port Talbot hospital, or our Emergency Department at Morriston Hospital due to a fall. If a patient has attended more than once in a year, they will only be counted once.
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022 to date

	4923
	4570
	4549
	1583




3. For comparison purposes, please will you also provide annualised data regarding the recorded numbers of miscarriages and stillbirths in 2019, 2020, 2021 and 2022 to date?

I can confirm that Swansea Bay Health Board does not record data on miscarriages.  Please see below the number of stillbirths recorded:
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022 to date

	18
	17
	15
	19
	10
	5



4. For comparison purposes, please will you also provide annualised data regarding the recorded numbers of cardiac arrests in 2019, 2020, 2021 and 2022 to date?
You clarified on 25th April 2022 you would like this information relating specifically to cardiac myopathy, myocarditis, pericarditis, cardiac arrest, palpitations, tachycardia, chest pain, fainting and heart attacks.

Please note that we have provided the number of admissions and MIU/Emergency Department attendances for the above issues. If a patient has attended/been admitted more than once, they will be counted for each attendance/admission.

Inpatient admissions
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022 to 31/03

	7767
	6597
	6960
	1467


Emergency Department Attendances
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022 to 30/04

	7580
	6745
	8449
	2873



5. For comparison purposes, please will you also provide annualised data regarding the recorded numbers of emergency cardiac events in patients under the age of 18 in 2019, 2020, 2021 and 2022 to date?
You clarified on 25th April 2022 you would like this information relating specifically to cardiac arrest, heart attack, chest pain, palpitations, cardiac myopathy, pericarditis, myocarditis, tachycardia and fainting.

Inpatient admissions
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022 to 31/03

	137
	74
	132
	35


Emergency Department Attendances
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022 to 30/04

	328
	220
	380
	159



6. Finally, please will you indicate the number of children treated as inpatients for coronavirus in 2020?
You clarified on 25th April 2022 that you are referring to patients aged 18 and under.

12 patients under the age of 18 were admitted as inpatients due to COVID-19 in calendar year 2020.

I hope this information is helpful. If you require anything further please contact us at FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk. 
Under the terms of the Health Board’s Freedom of Information policy, individuals seeking access to recorded information held by the Health Board are entitled to request internal review of the handling of their requests. If you would like to complain about the Health Board’s handling of your request please contact me directly at the address below or register your complaint via FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk. 
If after Internal Review you remain dissatisfied you are also entitled to refer the matter to the information commissioner at the Information Commissioner’s Office (Wales), 2nd Floor, Churchill House, Churchill Way, Cardiff, CF10 2HH. Telephone Number: 0330 414 6421.  
Yours sincerely
[image: cid:image002.png@01D7E51B.D422D810]
Hazel Lloyd
Interim Director of Corporate Governance
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