Q

<5

o

G IG Bwrdd lechyd Prifysgol Cadeirydd/Chair: Emma Woollett

Bae Abertawe Prif Weithredwr/Chief Executive: Mark Hackett

N H S Swansea Bay University gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser

Health Board caring for each other, working together, always improving

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.
We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a

delay.

Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 22-H-025

You asked:

Please note we have provided data below for the 4 month period - April-July 2022

Q1. How many patients have been treated (for any condition) in the last 4
months with:
e Benralizumab - 14
e Omalizumab - 21 issued via the Health Boards pharmacy system, although there may
well be a higher number of patients, as prescriptions can be issued via community
pharmacies, however we do not hold this information.
e Reslizumab - 0
e Mepolizumab - 23

Q2. Of the patients treated in the last 4 months with any of the above
products, please provide the number of patients by the following age-
groups:

e Age6-11-0

e Age 12-17-0

e Age 18 and above - 58

Q3. How many patients have been treated in the last 4 months with
Dupilumab for:

e Asthma ONLY -0

e Chronic rhinosinusitis with nasal polyps ONLY - 0

Q4. How many patients have been treated in the last 4 months with
Omalizumab for: Unknown indication
e Asthma ONLY - This information is not held centrally
e Chronic rhinosinusitis with nasal polyps ONLY - This information is not held centrally
e Chronic Spontaneous Urticaria ONLY - This information is not held centrally

To obtain this information for question 4 would involve a manual trawl and search of
records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down
by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of
Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides
that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating,
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retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information
and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.
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