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I refer to your Freedom of Information Act Request acknowledged by ourselves on 

19th December 2019.  Your request sought information relating to local diagnostic 

pathways.  You clarified on the 16th January 2020 that you are interested in pathways 

which come after a diagnosis of cancer. 

Please provide your local diagnostic pathways for the following tumour 

types? 

1. Sarcoma (soft tissue) - attached 
 

2. Gastrointestinal stromal tumours (GIST) - this information is not held* 
 

3. Thyroid cancer - this information is not held* 

 
4. Mammary analogue secretory carcinoma (MASC) – this information is not held* 

 
5. Cholangiocarcinoma - this information is not held* 

 

6. Pancreatic cancer -  this information is not held* 

*Please note that the majority of cancers listed above will not have standard 

patient pathway, this is due to the intricate variations of each pathway dependant 

on patient diagnosis.  All referrals will get discussed at Multi-Disciplinary Team 

(MDT) meetings and management plans for each patient will be discussed at 

these meetings. 
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I hope this information is helpful. If you require anything further please contact us at 

FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk.  

Under the terms of the Health Board’s Freedom of Information policy, individuals 

seeking access to recorded information held by the Health Board are entitled to 

request internal review of the handling of their requests. If you would like to complain 

about the Health Board’s handling of your request please contact me directly at the 

address below or register your complaint via FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk.  

If after Internal Review you remain dissatisfied you are also entitled to refer the 

matter to the information commissioner at the Information Commissioner’s Office 

(Wales), 2nd Floor, Churchill House, Churchill Way, Cardiff, CF10 2HH. Telephone 

Number: 029 2067 8400.   

Yours sincerely 

 

Pam Wenger 

Director of Corporate Governance 

mailto:FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk
mailto:FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk



